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6678 County Road 32, Norwich, New York 13815-3554
(607) 335-1200 * FAX (607) 334-9848

To: Participating Districts

From: Jackie Lisk

Date: May 1, 2024

Re: Cooperative Purchasing Text & Library Book Bid Awards #2024-106

RESULTS & AWARDS:
The bid was opened on March 21, 2024 and resulted in 15 bid submissions. Two bid submissions were
rejected due to the exceptions taken within the bid document and shipping charges.

On April 3, 2024, the bid award recommendations were presented to the DCMO BOCES Board. The bid
award recommendations were approved and awarded by the Board.

Please see the attached “Text Book & Library Book Bid Awards” in a PDF format. These are the results of
the bid award recommendations. Any district in the service may take advantage of this award, even if the
district did not participate in the initial requisitioning of items. The vendor contact sheet will give you
additional information regarding the awarded bidder, such as the address, phone number, contact person,
etc.

Please make sure your PO’s include the Bid Number 2024-106 and any Vendor Specific
Reference # if applicable

IMPORTANT BID INFORMATION:
Please note that according to our contract the awarded vendors must follow these terms:

e Must deliver and invoice within 35 days from the date the vendor confirms they received the
purchase order. (If a vendor fails to deliver in this time, please contact our office, as we may
implement the Buy Against Clause)

Pricing is firm until 4/30/25.

Must provide the brand they specified on the bid throughout the bid contract.

Must not substitute any item unless they have advance approval from the district.

Cannot say an item is discontinued or no longer available, and offer you a higher priced item. —

PLEASE CONTACT US IMMEDIATELY - Substitutions must be at the bid price.

Must not include shipping, handling or fuel surcharges on any order meeting minimum.

® You can combine orders for other items not on bid with any purchase order containing bid items
to reach the minimum ordering amount (if applicable).



6678 County Road 32, Norwich, New York 13815-3554
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DISCOUNTS:

The vendors who offer discounts off their website or catalog are listed below. If the item you need is not
within this bid, you can search for the item utilizing the discounts from the vendors to ensure that you are
getting the best possible price. Sometimes a 15% discount from one vendor is better than a 20% discount
from another vendor but you must do your research and also look at minimum order amounts. Please
review the discount analysis for further information.

NO BID ITEMS/REJECTED ITEMS

If you see any price that shows as $0.00 on any reports or online this means the item in question did NOT
RECEIVE A BID. The item was either discontinued or not available from the vendors who provided a
bid. The No Bid items may have a suitable substitution within the bid awards.

PRODUCT QUALITY / VENDOR ISSUE RESOLUTION PROCESS:

If you have a Product Quality problem or Vendor Issue, please follow the process below:

1. Call the vendor contact person. Note the date and time you called about the issue. Make sure to
have them give you a time or date that the problem will be resolved. Make sure you get the
person’s name and their phone number.

2. If the problem is not resolved or the person you spoke to is not responsive to correcting the
problem, please email us the information below:
a. Details of the problem
The company you having an issue with
The PO Number and/or Invoice number
Your customer number
The person’s name at the company you spoke to about the issue and their phone #
Variance form

moeaoe o

Once we have the information we will work with the vendor and copy you on the email. If you need to
speak with us for any reason, you can email us at cooppur@dcmoboces.com. Feel free to call or email us
with your issues or concerns. We will try our best to get it sorted!

READING THE PDF AWARDS:
To search the PDF, there is a “find” box in the tool bar or use CTL & F on your keyboard. A search bar
will appear and from there you can type in any keyword to find the items you are looking for.
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Vendor Contact Information

Vendor Contact Phone/Fax Notes/Ref #

A to Z Books, LL.C Ehzabeth Sellan P 888-368-6742 $25.00 minimum
380 Woodward Crescent sales@atozbooksllc.com F- 716-539-4004 rder
West Seneca, NY 14224 WWW ) et orde
Adanl‘,sOB};’gf 1C2(;2 LLC ) l\flg“el ionzalﬁz . P:800-221-0909 |  $25.00 minimum

F: 888-229-2650 order

New York, NY 10009

www.adamsbook.com

C.S. Miller Books
14 Adams Street
Norwich, NY 13815

Jason Miller

info@csmillerbooks.com

www.csmillerbooks.com

P

: 607-373-0033

No minimum order

Carson Dellosa Education
6657-A Brigham Road
Greensboro, NC 27409

Tracy Gavern
School accounts@carsondellosa.com

www.carsondellos.com/schools

P: 800-321-0943 x

Please email
orders

4269

No minimum order

Childswork/Childsplay
40 Aero Rd. Unit 2
Bohemia, NY 11716

Michael Surrey
mike@guidance-group.com
www.childswork.com

g

:631-619-2600

No minimum order

Complete Book & Media Supply

1200 Toro Grande Dr ) She;Hf‘“gmvek - P: 512-616-0400 $25.00 minimum
Suite 200 - F: 512-616-0410 order

Cedar Park, TX 78613 www.completebook.com

Lakeshore Learning Penny Stone Reference

2695 E. Dominguez Street
Carson, CA 90895

orderdept@]lakeshorelearning.com
www.lakeshorelearning.com

Lehrbook, LLC
8 Yale Drive
Monsey, NY 10952

: 800-778-4456
: 800-537-5403

“Per Bid #2024-106"
No minimum order

Brenda Friedman

bids@lehrbook.com

www.lehrbook.com

Perfection Learning Corporation
1000 N Second Ave.
Logan, IA 51546

: 845-262-2864

$25.00 minimum
order

Customer Service

orders@perfectionlearning.com

www.perfectionlearning.com

: 800-831-4190
: 800-543-2745

No minimum order

Perma-Bound Books
617 East Vandalia Road
Jacksonville, IL 62650

Debbie Northcutt
books@perma-bound.com

www.perma-bound.com

: 800-637-6581
: 800-551-1169

No minimum order

Textbook Warehouse, LL.C
936 Curie Drive
Alpharetta, GA 30005

James Adams

sales@texbookwarehouse.com

www.textbookwarehouse.com

: 800-796-9152
: 800-796-9154

$25.00 minimum
order
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Discounts Offered for Items NOT on Bid

Vendor Discount % Applies to Exceptions/Exclusions
A to Z Books, LL.C 12% Website Pricing $25.00 min for free shipping
Carson Dellosa Education 30% List Price $30.00 minimum order for fr'ee shipping
Excluded: Clearance or sale items
. 32% Trade .. .
Complete Book & Media $25.00 minimum order for free shipping

15% Workbook Publishers Price

Supply 10% Textbook Excludes net priced items




DCMO BOCES Textbooks & Books Bid 2024-106

uo Description BOCES Vendor Bid Alternate Awarded
M Item # Product # Price Brand Vendor
Assessments, Forms & Booklets

EAC | Document-Based Questions for Reading 22686 9781420683752 $11.24 Complete Book

H Comprehension and Critical Thinking: Gr 5 - & Media Supply
1609561

EAC | WRS End of Step Assessment, Steps (1-6), Set, 4th 37831 978156778647 $40.11 Complete Book
H edition & Media Supply

EAC | The ASCA National Model: A Framework for School 40411 9781929289592 $56.33 Complete Book
H Counseling Programs, 4th Edition, Used & Media Supply

PKG | Examination Blue Books, 7 X 8-1/2, 16 Pages - 085461 NO BID NO BID

50/Pkg
Common Core

EAC | Common Core Reteaching and Practice Workbook - 24643 9780328697625 $5.85 Textbook Warehouse
H Grade 5 - ISBN 9780328697625

EAC | 5th Grade Envision Common Core 17635 9780328697625 $6.15 Textbook Warehouse
H Re-Teaching/Practice Workbook - 0328697621

EAC | Carson-Dellosa Common Core Math 4 Today 29481 9781624426025 $6.26 Textbook Warehouse
H Workbook, Grade 4 - 1466554

EAC | Common Core Math 4 Today Workbook 22706 9781624425998 $6.26 Textbook Warehouse
H Carson-Dellosa , Grade 1 - 1466551

EAC | Reading Comprehension and Skills, Common Core 1497321 9781478867654 $7.52 Textbook Warehouse
H Edition, Grade 6

EAC | Common Core Reading Warm-Ups & Test Practice 1498488 9781478806677 $13.52 Textbook Warehouse
H Book - Gr 8

SET | Common Core Math Cards - Gr 6 1497368 9781621208709 $21.98 Textbook Warehouse

EAC | Common Core Math Cards - Gr 7 1497369 9781621208730 $21.98 Textbook Warehouse
H

EAC | Daily Comprehension Common Core Practice 22903 DD814 $4.62 Lakeshore Learning
H Journal, Gr 4-5 - (Lakeshore Learning PP455) (Per Bid #2024-106)

EAC | Daily Comprehension Common Core Practice 22905 DD813 $4.62 Lakeshore Learning
H Journal, Grades 3-4 - (Lakeshore Learning PP454) (Per Bid #2024-106)

EAC | Daily Math Practice Journal - Gr 5 - (Lakeshore 1470912 EE945 $4.62 Lakeshore Learning
H Learning PP301) (Per Bid #2024-106)




DCMO BOCES Textbooks & Books Bid 2024-106

uo Description BOCES Vendor Bid Alternate Awarded
M Item # Product # Price Brand Vendor
SET | Daily Comprehension Common Core Practice 22907 DD817 $45.32 Lakeshore Learning
Journal, Gr 1-2 - 10/Set - (Lakeshore Learning - (Per Bid #2024-106)
DD817)
EAC | Newmark Learning Common Core Comprehension 22700 NO BID NO BID
H Reproducible Book, Grade 5
EAC | Ready New York CCLS - ELA Grade 6 Instruction 364662 NO BID NO BID
H Books for Students Consumable
Managing Emotions
EAC | A Little SPOT of Anxiety: A Story About Calming Your 56192 9781951287054 $8.75 Textbook Warehouse
H Worries by Diane Alber
EAC | A Little Peaceful SPOT: A Story About Mindfulness by 56194 9781951287085 $8.75 Textbook Warehouse
H Diane Alber
EAC | A Little Spot of Anger: A Story About Managing BIG 56195 9781951287030 $8.75 Textbook Warehouse
H Emotions by Diane Alber
EAC | Therapy Games for Teens: 150 Activities to Improve 202228 9781647397760 $10.48 Textbook Warehouse
H Self-Esteem, Communication, and Coping Skills
Paperback by Kevin Gruzewski CTRS (Author)
EAC | The Grit Workbook for Kids: CBT Skills to Help Kids 4146 9781684035984 $10.54 Textbook Warehouse
H Cultivate a Growth Mindset and Build Resilience
EAC | Creative Therapy Store Mindful Games (book), 49654 9781611803693 $10.64 Textbook Warehouse
H 110H21600
EAC | Handbook for Helping Kids With Anxiety and Stress, 49646 9781889636573 $14.80 Textbook Warehouse
H BK-YHKA
EAC | The Shyness and Social Anxiety Workbook 37838 9781626253407 $16.92 Textbook Warehouse
H
EAC | Think Good, Feel Good: A Cognitive Behavioural 4147 9781119395287 $28.31 Textbook Warehouse
H Therapy Workbook for Children and Young People
2nd Edition by Paul Stallard
EAC | Teen Guide to Social & Emotional Skills (5 book set) 37832 S025 $31.29 Textbook Warehouse
H
EAC | Research Press Publishers--Don't Let Your Emotions 49617 9781626258594 $15.35 Complete Book
H Run Your Life for Kids & Media Supply
EAC | I Bet | Won't Fret: A Workbook to Help Children with 49647 9781572246003 $17.78 Complete Book
H Generalized Anxiety Disorder, BX-IBWF & Media Supply
EAC | Creative CBT Interventions for Children With 49648 9780995172500 $20.21 Complete Book
H Anxiety, BX-XXCC & Media Supply




DCMO BOCES Textbooks & Books Bid 2024-106

uo Description BOCES Vendor Bid Alternate Awarded
M Item # Product # Price Brand Vendor
SET | Social Thinking and Me Think Sheets for Social 202214 ISBN: 4500 $64.99 Childswork/Childspla
Emotional learning (2 book set), ISBN-10: y
1936943387, ISBN-13: 978-1936943388
EAC | Trauma-Informed Social-Emotional Toolbox for 4148 B-C7G5 $21.49 Childswork/Childspla
H Children & Adolescents: 116 Worksheets & y
Skill-Building Exercises to Support Safety,
Connection & Empowerment by Lisa Weed Phifer
and Laura Sibbald
EAC | Between the Lines, Enhancing Inferencing Skills, 49447 TPX29901 $33.95 Childswork/Childspla
H TPX-29901 y
EAC | CBT toolbox for children and adolescents with 49549 BX-PCBZ $23.59 Childswork/Childspla
H anxiety BX-PCBZ y
EAC | Think Social! A Social Thinking Curriculum for 56268 9780970132048 $91.99 Childswork/Childspla
H School-Age Students - ISBN: 9780970132048 v
EAC | The Zones of Regulation: A Curriculum Designed to 56270 9780982523162 $59.99 Childswork/Childspla
H Foster Self-Regulation and Emotional Control, by %
Leah Kuypers - ISBN: 9780982523162
EAC | Social Skills Matter 04145 804112 $16.80 Carson Dellosa
H Publishing, LLC
SET | In Focus (5 Book Set) 37833 NO BID NO BID
History
EAC | United States History and Government Brief Review 56236 9781418310721 $8.15 Textbook Warehouse
H 2020 Framework Based Edition, Briggs/ Fish
Peterson - ISBN 978-1-4183-1072-1
EAC | Social Studies School Service, AP US History Secret 56290 9781265259334 $20.00 Textbook Warehouse
H Study Guide
EAC | Savvas Global regents review books 9781420000000 37818 9781418835187 $21.10 Textbook Warehouse
H
EAC | History Book Land of Hope: An Invitation to the 56191 9781594039379 $31.34 Textbook Warehouse
H Great American Story, Wilfred M. McClay
EAC | US History- Book 1: Beginnings to 1876 56267 9781560775140 $41.63 Textbook Warehouse
H
EAC | America: History of Our Nation Teacher's Ed 36089 9780133230093 $75.00 Textbook Warehouse
H 9780133230093
EAC | World History Chart & Timeline, Social Studies 56266 3P1634 $26.31 Complete Book
H School Services & Media Supply




DCMO BOCES Textbooks & Books Bid 2024-106

uo Description BOCES Vendor Bid Alternate Awarded
M Item # Product # Price Brand Vendor
SET | McGraw Hill, Discovering Our Past: A History of the 202209 9780076767366 $27.94 Complete Book
World, Chapter Tests & Lesson Quizzes, ISBN 13: & Media Supply
9780076767366
EAC | Basic Principles of American Government, Student 49513 1995106 $42.11 Complete Book
H Textbook, Perfection Learning - 1995106 & Media Supply
EAC | Prentice Hall Brief Review: US History and 37805 NO BID NO BID
H Government Briggs/Fish Peterson 2019
EAC | 2018-19 Prentice Hall Brief Review, US History and 49560 NO BID NO BID
H Government, ISBN 0-328-98339-X
SET | Global History and Geography Student Edition 2020 56230 NO BID NO BID
Mathematics
SET | Key to Algebra- Books 1 thru 10 1st edition, ISBN-13 56189 $53.48 Adams Book Co. Inc.
978-1559530880
EAC | Algebrall - Barron's Regents Exams and Answers 37182 9781438008431 $5.63 Textbook Warehouse
H Revised Edition Review Books
Red Books
EAC | Daily Math Practice 5th Grade 9-302281-030 28681 9781609632625 $5.64 Textbook Warehouse
H
EAC | My Math Kindergarten Workbook Volume 1 364703 9780021150199 $7.20 Textbook Warehouse
H ISBN-13 978-0021150199
EAC | My Math Kindergarten Workbook Volume 2 364704 9780021160679 $7.20 Textbook Warehouse
H ISBN-13 978-0021160679
EAC | Mackin Let's Review: Algebra I, ISBN 49565 9781438006048 $9.36 Textbook Warehouse
H 9781438006048
EAC | Mackin Let's Review: Algebra Il, ISBN 49567 9781506277462 $11.86 Textbook Warehouse
H 9781438008448
EAC | NY Practice Coach PLUS, Revised Empire Edition, 364666 9781683512639 $13.28 Textbook Warehouse
H Math - Grade 4 Item# 1611953
EAC | NY Practice Coach PLUS, Revised Empire Edition, 364665 9781683512653 $13.28 Textbook Warehouse
H Math - Grade 6 - School Specialty
EAC | Shell Education Elementary Middle School 180 Days 17548 9781425808020 $14.41 Textbook Warehouse
H of Math for Sixth Grade - 1438446
EAC | Doing Math in Morning Meeting: 150 Quick 202218 9781892989376 $20.88 Textbook Warehouse
H Activities That Connect to Your Curriculum

(Responsive Classroom), ISBN-13: 978-1892989376,
ISBN-10: 1892989379




DCMO BOCES Textbooks & Books Bid 2024-106

uo Description BOCES Vendor Bid Alternate Awarded
M Item # Product # Price Brand Vendor
EAC | Glencoe Math 2016- Grade 6, McGraw- Hill - 56227 9780076698004 $30.71 Textbook Warehouse
H ISBN:978-0-07-669800-4
EAC | Mathematizing Your School: Creating a Culture for 202219 9781138323230 $31.54 Textbook Warehouse
H Math Success 1st Edition, ISBN-13: 978-1138323230,
ISBN-10: 1138323233
SET | Remedia, Beginning Straight Foward Math, Grades 202220 GP039A $61.70 Textbook Warehouse
2-5, 9 Book Set
SET | Remedia, Advanced Straight Forward Math, Grades 202222 GPO31A $71.92 Textbook Warehouse
4-8, 12 Book Set
EAC | Consumer Mathematics Workbook Answer Key - 14949 9780785429463 $5.65 Complete Book
H ISBN-13: 9780785429463 & Media Supply
EAC | Geometry - Barron's Regents Exams and Answers 37814 9781506266343 $11.09 | quoted new edition Complete Book
H New Edition Review Books - Red Books & Media Supply
EAC | Algebra | - Barron's Regents Exams and Answers 37813 9781506291291 $12.57 | quoted new edition Complete Book
H New Edition Review Books, Red Books & Media Supply
EAC | Math Logic & Word Problems - Grade 5-6 - 087622 17576 9781591981176 $16.55 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
EAC | My Math- Grade 4 - ISBN - 978-0-07-906306-9 56226 9780079063069 $29.03 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
EAC | My Math- Grade 5 - ISBN: 978-0-07-906307-6 56277 9780079063076 $29.89 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
EAC | Response to Intervention in Math Book - 1441661 17584 9781412966351 $37.55 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
EAC | Mackin Let's Review: Geometry, ISBN 49566 NO BID NO BID
H 9781438007021
EAC | Algebral- Books - 978-0-578-19771-5 56218 NO BID NO BID
H
Miscellaneous
EAC | Map Skills for Today Grade 5 - 613032 K1096 9781338214925 $3.15 Textbook Warehouse
H
EAC | The Everything Guide to Study Skills: Strategies, tips, 202226 9781440507441 $10.00 Textbook Warehouse
H and tools you need to succeed in school! Paperback
by Cynthia C Muchnick
EAC | Instant Personal Poster Set - ISBN13:9780439152853 56312 9780439152853 $10.98 Textbook Warehouse




DCMO BOCES Textbooks & Books Bid 2024-106

uo Description BOCES Vendor Bid Alternate Awarded
M Item # Product # Price Brand Vendor
EAC | School to Career - Student Workbook 37837 9781649257369 $28.20 Textbook Warehouse
H
SET | Money Basics (5 Book Set) 37835 S004 $31.13 Textbook Warehouse
EAC | Cengage - An Introduction to Policing, 9th Edition, 202200 9781337558754 $109.5 Textbook Warehouse
H John S. Dempsey; Linda S. Forst; Steven B. Carter, 5
ISBN-10: 1-337-55875-3, ISBN-13:
978-1-337-55875-4
EAC | Brain Games 9781430000000 37820 9781426320705 $9.61 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
EAC | Biodiversity at the Bell Kit, 30 Workbooks 56284 4606801 $44.61 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
EAC | Explore Your Community Introductory Kit 4142 AT1071 $67.68 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
EAC | Animal Science, Ag Tech Agribusiness 37188 NO BID NO BID
H
EAC | Whole Body Listening Larry poster - ISBN: 56313 NO BID NO BID
H 9781936943432
Phonics
EAC | Spectrum Paperback Word Study and Phonics Book - | 1497300 9781483811840 $8.15 Textbook Warehouse
H Gr3
EAC | Week by Week Phonics And Word Study Activities - 14307 9780439465892 $11.92 Textbook Warehouse
H 1396135
EAC | Phonics For Struggling Readers - 1369438 14278 9781596732193 $18.83 Textbook Warehouse
H
EAC | Book, Phonology, Giant, Super Duper # BK265 28492 BK265 $45.05 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
EAC | Teaching Phonic Skills - LL929 50879 LL929 $36.99 Lakeshore Learning
H (Per Bid #2024-106)
EAC | Stack and Build Phonics Flip Books - TT331 50923 TT331 $46.24 Lakeshore Learning
H (Per Bid #2024-106)
SET | 95 Phonics Skill Series, Short Vowels, Student 202229 NO BID NO BID
Workbook Package, PH4030.05
Reading
EAC | Casa Dividida (reader) Teacher's Discovery 364663 978-1-60372-161- $8.00 Adams Book Co. Inc.

5




DCMO BOCES Textbooks & Books Bid 2024-106

uo Description BOCES Vendor Bid Alternate Awarded

M Item # Product # Price Brand Vendor

EAC | Follett - This is not my hat by Jon Klassen by 51040 978-1536228052 $8.99 5 or more cost is Adams Book Co. Inc.
H Hardcover - 0813WA6 $6.74

EAC | Follett - Pete & Pickles by Berke Breathed Hardcover 51047 978-0618548897 $9.99 | 5 or more cost is Adams Book Co. Inc.
H -16120W1 $7.49

EAC | Pictures of Hollis Woods-Novel 9780440415787 37836 9780440415787 $5.55 Textbook Warehouse
H

EAC | Follett - Charlie Anderson by Barbara Abercrombie 37809 9780689801143 $5.64 Textbook Warehouse
H Paperback - 34245P7

EAC | Follett - Piggie pie! By Margie Palatini Paperback - 51059 9780395866184 $5.64 Textbook Warehouse
H 33153P9

EAC | We Love to Swim Guided Reading Books, Pioneer 49554 9781584539414 $6.96 Textbook Warehouse
H Valley Books - ETW-C14sp

EAC | Survivors of the Holocaust: True Stories of Six 04301 9780545741651 $9.39 Textbook Warehouse
H Extraordinary Children by Kath Shackleton

SET | I Survived Graphic Novels #1-4: A Graphix Collection 37824 9781338787917 $27.60 Textbook Warehouse

9781340000000

SET | Jack and Daisy Early Readers - 6/Set JD3CP 36100 JD3CP $35.39 Textbook Warehouse

SET | Spotlight on Literary Elements Book Set - 301509EAS 36111 9780545067638 $53.28 Textbook Warehouse

EAC | Dog Man Collection (Books #1-10) 9781340000000 37821 9781338792164 $81.80 Textbook Warehouse
H

EAC | Esperanza Rising, Scholastic Books- ISBN 49580 9780439120425 $4.95 | ISBN 9780439120425 A to Z Books, LLC
H 9780439120425

EAC | Follett - A bad case of stripes by David Shannon 51064 9780439598385 $4.95 A to Z Books, LLC
H Paperback - 35559N7

EAC | Best Christmas Pageant Ever, ISBN 9780064402750 36123 9780064402750 $5.57 | ISBN 9780064402750 A to Z Books, LLC
H

EAC | Follett - Knots on a counting rope by Bill Martin 51050 9780805054798 $5.57 A to Z Books, LLC
H Paperback - 21143M5

EAC | Follett - When lightning comes in a jar by Patricia 51070 9780142403501 $5.57 A to Z Books, LLC
H Polacco Paperback - 38555Y1

EAC | Inside Out and Back Again - Paperback - Prestwick 37806 9780061962790 $6.19 A to Z Books, LLC
H House

EAC | The Witches: The Graphic Novel 9781340000000 37829 9781338677430 $9.29 A to Z Books, LLC
H

EAC | Follett - Ish by Peter H Reynolds Hardcover - 51051 9780763623449 $9.30 A to Z Books, LLC
H 25115Q1




DCMO BOCES Textbooks & Books Bid 2024-106

uo Description BOCES Vendor Bid Alternate Awarded
M Item # Product # Price Brand Vendor
EAC | Follett - Enemy Pie by Derek Munson Hardcover - 51044 9780811827782 $11.04 A to Z Books, LLC
H 1146517
EAC | Follett - Memorias del aguila y del Allende 56209 9780525433637 $12.40 A to Z Books, LLC
H
SET | Smile, Sisters, and Guts: The Box Set 37828 9781338599459 $21.68 A to Z Books, LLC
9781340000000
EAC | Follett - Ruby the copycat by Peggy Rathmann 51057 9780439472289 $4.65 Complete Book
H Paperback - 32837T1 & Media Supply
EAC | Follett - My rotten redheaded older brother by 51069 9780689820366 $4.95 Complete Book
H Patricia Polacco Paperback - 37477L2 & Media Supply
EAC | Follett - The perfectly messed-up story by Patrick 51038 9780316222587 $9.85 Complete Book
H McDonnell Hardcover - 0736NQ7 & Media Supply
EAC | Follett - The most magnificent thing by Ashley Spires 51039 9781554537044 $10.15 Complete Book
H Hardcover - 0764CM8 & Media Supply
EAC | Follett - The Recess Queen by Alexis O'Neill 51041 9780439206372 $10.35 Complete Book
H Hardcover - 09680M5 & Media Supply
EAC | Follett - Tops & bottoms by Janet Stevens Hardcover 37799 9780152928513 $10.85 Complete Book
H -16953G5 & Media Supply
SET | Raise a Reader Set: Graphix Coming of Age Pack 37827 9780545517652 $28.84 Complete Book
& Media Supply
SET | A Bike Ride for Jack Guided Reading Books From 36103 JD92SP $30.08 Complete Book
Pioneer Valley Books - JD92SP & Media Supply
SET | Animal Tails Guided Reading Books, Pioneer Valley 49553 ENF12SP $30.08 Complete Book
Books - ENF12sp & Media Supply
SET | Bella and Rosie Blue set br7ap 36097 Br7ap $30.08 Complete Book
& Media Supply
EAC | Bella and Rosie Early Readers br5ap 37808 br5ap $30.08 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
PKG | Blast Off! Pioneer Valley Books/PW220sp 36106 PW220sp $30.08 Complete Book
& Media Supply
SET | RUSTY THE ROBOT READING SET 1 41290 RUS1ap $30.08 Complete Book
& Media Supply
EAC | What'sin Ned's Head by Goliath 37811 B084TS1D1P $32.90 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
SET | Who Would Win? Value Set (Pack of 8) 37830 9781338157611 $51.74 Complete Book

9781340000000

& Media Supply




DCMO BOCES Textbooks & Books Bid 2024-106

uo Description BOCES Vendor Bid Alternate Awarded
M Item # Product # Price Brand Vendor
PKG | I Survived Collection #1-20 (Pack of 20) 37823 9780545517652 $84.95 Complete Book
9781340000000 & Media Supply
SET | Bella and Rosie Early Chapter Books Pioneer Valley 36095 BR4cp $122.2 Complete Book
Books/BR4cp 0 & Media Supply
SET | HIP Jr. Pack 4143 HIPJRP $137.8 Complete Book
0 & Media Supply
EAC | Follett - EImer and Rose by David McKee Hardcover - 51046 $9.20 C.S. Miller Books
H 15937G7
EAC | Follett - Thank you, Mr. Falker by Patricia Polacco 51034 9780399257629 $9.20 LehrBook LLC
H Hardcover - 0088PV0
EAC | Follett - Mr. Wayne's masterpiece by Patricia Polacco 51036 9780399160950 $11.50 LehrBook LLC
H Hardcover - 0530GPO
EAC | Follett - The invisible boy by Trudy Ludwig Hardcover 51037 9781582464503 $11.50 LehrBook LLC
H - 0613ZH6
EAC | Making Friends Is an Art! Paperback book, 2nd 202223 9781944882563 $7.67 2nd Edition Perfection Learning
H Edition Corporation
EAC | Story Works' ISBN:1316499 164999 36117 NO BID NO BID
H
EAC | Classic Fairy Tales Pack 8M5 36121 NO BID NO BID
H
EAC | House on Hackman's Hill' ISBN:9780590423700 36122 NO BID NO BID
H NTS42370
SET | Hi Noon Books: High Interest, Low Reading Level 37795 NO BID NO BID
Reading book set
EAC | The Littlest EIf Picture Book 37179 9780545436540 $3.13 Textbook Warehouse
H
EAC | Frosty the Snowman Picture Book 37176 9780307960382 $3.76 Textbook Warehouse
H
EAC | The 7 Habits of Highly Effective Teens by Sean Covey 364722 9780762414741 $4.98 Textbook Warehouse
H - Hardcover - ISBN: 978-0762414741
EAC | The Golden Goblet by Eloise Jarvis McGraw - ISBN 56145 9780140303353 $5.55 Textbook Warehouse
H 978-0-14-030335-3
EAC | Home of the Brave by Katherine Applegate - 56147 9780312535636 $5.64 Textbook Warehouse
H ISBN-13: 9780312535636
EAC | The Sign of the Beaver by Elizabeth George Speare 495415 9780547577111 $6.14 Textbook Warehouse




DCMO BOCES Textbooks & Books Bid 2024-106

uo Description BOCES Vendor Bid Alternate Awarded
M Item # Product # Price Brand Vendor
EAC | Of Mice and Men by John Steinbeck, Everbind Books 49551 9780140177398 $8.15 Textbook Warehouse
H - CS40177398
SET | The Kane Chronicles, Paperback Box Set (with 56306 9780439152853 $10.02 Textbook Warehouse
Graphic Novel Sampler) Paperback -
ISBN13:9780439152853
EAC | Last Chance to See by Douglas Adams and Mark 364719 9780345371980 $11.30 Textbook Warehouse
H Carwardine ISBN: 978-0345371980
EAC | Rebekah - Girl Detective Books 1-8: Fun Short Story 56149 9780615877594 $11.45 Textbook Warehouse
H Mysteries for Children Ages 9-12 (The Mysterious
Garden, Alien Invasion, Magellan Goes Missing,
Ghost Hunting,Grown-Ups Out To Get Us?! + 3
more!) - ISBN-10: 0615877591 ISBN-13:
978-0615877594
EAC | Dog Man #1-6 Boxed Set, Hardcover - ISBN-13: 56154 9781338603347 $48.16 Textbook Warehouse
H 978-1338603347
EAC | Harry Potter Paperback Box Set (Books 1-7) ISBN-13: 56148 9780545162074 $62.70 Textbook Warehouse
H 978-0545162074
EAC | The Night Before Christmas Picture Book 37180 5318257 $6.59 Perma-Bound Books
H
EAC | Shine, By Lauren Myracle - 0810984172 14290 70124 $9.72 Perma-Bound Books
H
EAC | Christmas Mouse Picture Book 37175 #5423446 $11.00 Perma-Bound Books
H
EAC | Journey by Patricia MacLachlan (paperback) 36502 9780440408093 $3.71 A to Z Books, LLC
H ISBN-10: 0440408091
EAC | Rudolph the Red-Nosed Reindeer - picture book 37817 9780307988294 $3.71 A to Z Books, LLC
H ISBN-10: 0307988295
EAC | Dragon of the Red Dawn, Mary Pop Osborne 56190 9780375837289 $4.33 A to Z Books, LLC
H
EAC | Red Midnight novels by Ben Mikaelsen - 364723 9780380805617 $4.33 A to Z Books, LLC
H Perma-Bound Books
EAC | Soft Rain: A Story of the Cherokee Trail of Tears 364724 9780440412427 $4.95 A to Z Books, LLC
H (paperback) - ISBN-10: 0440412420
EAC | Hush By Jacqueline Woodson - 1606-866559 866559 9780142415511 $5.57 A to Z Books, LLC
H
EAC | Island of the Blue Dolphins by Scott O'Dell, ISBN 49509 9780547328614 $5.57 ISBN 9780547328614 A to Z Books, LLC

9780547328614




DCMO BOCES Textbooks & Books Bid 2024-106
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M Item # Product # Price Brand Vendor
EAC | Percy Jackson and The Lightning Thief - Item# 51012 9781368051477 $5.57 A to Z Books, LLC
H NTS986130
EAC | Rules, by Cynthia Lord (paperback), Perfection 49514 9780439443838 $5.57 A to Z Books, LLC
H Learning -2817801
EAC | The Count of Monte Cristo by Alexandre Dumas 202225 9780140373530 $5.57 A to Z Books, LLC
H , Puffin Classic Version, ISBN-13 9780140373530
EAC | There's a Boy in the Girl's Bathroom - Literature 49526 9780394805726 $5.57 A to Z Books, LLC
H Group Paperback 30430K6
EAC | Walk Two Moons by Sharon Creech - ISBN-13: 56143 9780064405171 $5.57 A to Z Books, LLC
H 978-0064405171
EAC | Weird But True Sports: 300 Wacky Facts About 56155 9781426324673 $5.57 A to Z Books, LLC
H Awesome Athletics, Paperback - ISBN-10:
1426324677 ISBN-13: 978-1426324673
EAC | Harris and Me, by Gary Paulsen - Everbind Books 49516 9780152058807 $6.19 A to Z Books, LLC
H 52058807
EAC | Love That Dog by Saron Creech - paperback 56260 9780064409599 $6.19 A to Z Books, LLC
H
EAC | There's an Owl in the Shower by Jean Craighead 56144 9780064406826 $6.19 A to Z Books, LLC
H George - ISBN-13: 978-0-06-440682-6
EAC | The Ant Hill Disaster by Julia Cook (Author), Michelle 56171 9781937870270 $7.66 A to Z Books, LLC
H Hazelwood (Illustrator)
- ISBN-13: 978-1937870270
EAC | Sunny Side Up, graphic novel from Scholastic 56259 9780545741668 $8.05 A to Z Books, LLC
H
EAC | Miss Peregrine's Home For Peculiar Children, By 14272 9781594746031 $9.29 A to Z Books, LLC
H Ransom Riggs - 159-4744769
EAC | The Very Hungry Caterpillar book - hardcover 202227 9780399208539 $10.78 A to Z Books, LLC
H
SET | Warriors Box Set: Volumes 1 to 6: The Complete 56142 9780062367143 $33.44 A to Z Books, LLC
First Series (Warriors: The Prophecies Begin) -
ISBN-13: 978-0062367143
EAC | The Berenstain Bears and the Joy of Giving: The True 37178 9780310712558 $2.95 Complete Book
H Meaning of Christmas - picture book & Media Supply
SET | The Tail Of Emily Windsnap Series 8 Books Collection 56185 9789123671953 $34.77 Complete Book

Set By Liz Kessler - ISBN-13: 978-9123671953

& Media Supply
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EAC | Warrior Cats Volume 1 to 12 Books Collection Set - 56186 9789123876648 $80.19 Complete Book
H ISBN-13: 978-9123876648 & Media Supply
EAC | Man's Search for Meaning by Viktor Frankl - ISBN: 364721 $9.89 C.S. Miller Books
H 978-0807014295
EAC | Stargirl by Jerry Spinelli 495410 9780440416777 $5.75 LehrBook LLC
H
EAC | Einstein's Dreams by Alan Lightman 364720 9781400077809 $9.20 LehrBook LLC
H
EAC | Percy Jackson and The Lightning Thief, Hard cover 50961 9780786856299 $11.50 LehrBook LLC
H literature book by Rick Riordan - ISBN-13:
9780786856299
SET | Magnus Chase and the Gods of Asgard Paperback 202208 9781484780626 $18.40 LehrBook LLC
Boxed Set, ISBN-13: 978-1484780626
EAC | Percy Jackson and the Olympians 5 Book Paperback 56157 9781484707234 $20.70 LehrBook LLC
H Boxed Set (new covers w/poster) (Percy Jackson &
the Olympians) - ISBN-10: 1484707230 ISBN-13:
978-1484707234
SET | Judy Bloom's Fudge Box Set, Paperback - ISBN-10: 56146 9780142409060 $25.30 LehrBook LLC
9780142409060 ISBN-13: 978-0142409060
EAC | Pete the Cat: Snow Daze: A winter and holiday book 37177 9780062404268 $3.50 Perfection Learning
H for kids Corporation
EAC | The Ghost Boys by Jewell Parker Rhodes 495411 9780316262262 $5.60 Perfection Learning
H Corporation
EAC | The Outsiders by SE Hinton, Cliffs Notes, Houghton 49512 0925501 $9.10 Perfection Learning
H Mifflin Harcourt - 1730327 /9780140385724 Corporation
Reading Comprehension
EAC | Paired Passages: Linking Fact to Fiction Book, Grade 1498853 TCR2913 $14.39 Adams Book Co. Inc.
H 3
EAC | Paired Passages: Linking Fact to Fiction Book - Gr 6 1498856 | 978-1420629163 $18.12 Adams Book Co. Inc.
H
EAC | Paired Passages: Linking Fact to Fiction Book, Grade 1498854 | 978-1420629149 $18.12 Adams Book Co. Inc.
H 4
EAC | Touch & Read Vowel Sounds Match - GG368 50838 $33.98 Adams Book Co. Inc.
H
EAC | Daily Reading Comprehension Activities - Grade 1 - 22771 $33.99 Adams Book Co. Inc.
H (Lakeshore Learning DR341)




DCMO BOCES Textbooks & Books Bid 2024-106

uo Description BOCES Vendor Bid Alternate Awarded
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EAC | Making Inferences High-Interest Intervention 22844 $33.99 Adams Book Co. Inc.
H Reading Folders - (Lakeshore Learning FF743)
EAC | Vowel Teams Instant Learning Center - PP624 50686 $45.32 Adams Book Co. Inc.
H
SET | Word Family Readers - (Lakeshore Learning EE667) 29671 $56.65 Adams Book Co. Inc.
PKG | Conquer Close Reading grade 2 HEF-106485 49431 9781478822844 $6.90 Textbook Warehouse
PKG | Conquer Close Reading grade 5 HEF-106488 49433 9781478822875 $6.90 Textbook Warehouse
EAC | Figuratively Speaking Grade Level 5-8, LW1020 - 17572 9780881603170 $15.10 Textbook Warehouse
H 079493
EAC | Comprehension and Critical Thinking Grade 3 1394244 9781425802431 $15.69 Textbook Warehouse
H
SET | Let's Learn Textures Leveled Readers Set 56280 9781538249215 $41.20 Textbook Warehouse
SET | First Little Readers: Guided Reading Level D 49910 9781338111460 $58.30 Textbook Warehouse
Classroom Set Scholastic ISBN# 9781338111460
EAC | Decodable Reader, Library Non-fiction Phase 1-6 56222 020439 $130.7 Textbook Warehouse
H 9
SET | BKS Time for Kids International Text GR 1 English 1505479 9781433373930 $159.9 Textbook Warehouse
Set/30 1505479 5
EAC | Evan Moor Book Daily Reading Comprehension - 017580 9781629385150 $6.74 Complete Book
H Grade 4 - 1396286 & Media Supply
EAC | Evan Moor Daily Reading Comprehension, Grade 3 - 1396285 9781629385136 $6.74 Complete Book
H 1609559 & Media Supply
EAC | Curriculum Associates Quick word books - ISBN 56316 9780891875390 $8.71 Complete Book
H 978-0-8918-7539-0 & Media Supply
EAC | Scholastic Hi-Lo Passages to Build Comprehension, 088582 9780439548885 $8.90 Complete Book
H Grades5to 6 & Media Supply
SET Decodable Readers Phase 4 - Blend Non-Fiction 56221 9781608236749 $17.99 Complete Book
6/pkg & Media Supply
EAC | Evan-Moor Read and Understand with Leveled Texts, | 1329831 9781608236749 $17.99 Complete Book
H Grade 5 & Media Supply
EAC | Document-Based Questions for Reading 17577 TCR8374 $18.79 Complete Book
H Comprehension and Critical Thinking Grade & Media Supply
4,TCR8374 - 088965
EAC | S.P.L.R.E. Level 2 Reader, Third Edition, Instructional 41240 9780838857045 $19.73 Complete Book
H and Decodable, 24 Pages & Media Supply




DCMO BOCES Textbooks & Books Bid 2024-106
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EAC | SPIRE Level 2 reader - 9780838857045 364717 9780838857045 $19.73 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
SET | Big and Small Guided Reading Books, Pioneer Valley 49587 WB11sp $32.90 Complete Book
Books - WB11sp & Media Supply
EAC | Non-Fiction Sight-Word Readers, Level 1 - 22928 TT557 $62.65 Complete Book
H (Lakeshore Learning TT557) & Media Supply
SET | The Sound Out Info Mag Series, SP-2021-3-W (High 49582 SP-2021-3 $80.19 Complete Book
Noon Books: 20 Leveroni Court, Novato, CA & Media Supply
94949-5746)
EAC | Word Wisdom 2013 Gr 8 Teacher's Ed, Zaner-Bloser 37802 9780736792868 $83.71 Complete Book
H (800) 505-5563, 9780736792868 & Media Supply
SET | Language Theatre Books & Articulation Theatre 37816 LA1100 $223.0 Complete Book
Books Combo 9 & Media Supply
EAC | Daily Reading Comprehension Book, Evan-Moor - Gr 1396283 DD812 $4.62 Lakeshore Learning
H 1-1609557 (Per Bid #2024-106)
EAC | Reading Comprehension Grade 2, Teacher Created 203262 DD812 $4.62 Lakeshore Learning
H Resources - TCK3332 (Per Bid #2024-106)
SET Nonfiction Leveled Books, Level B (K) - 5/Set - 29111 LL712 $27.75 Lakeshore Learning
(Lakeshore Learning LL712) (Per Bid #2024-106)
SET | Nonfiction Leveled Books, Level C (K) - 5/Set - 29112 LL713 $28.68 Lakeshore Learning
(Lakeshore Learning LL713) (Per Bid #2024-106)
SET | Leveled Library Set One - Level B - (Lakeshore 28960 AA834 $30.53 Lakeshore Learning
Learning AA834) (Per Bid #2024-106)
SET | Leveled Library Set One - Level A - (Lakeshore 28959 AA833 $32.38 Lakeshore Learning
Learning AA833) (Per Bid #2024-106)
SET | Nonfiction Leveled Books, Level A (K) - 5/Set - 29110 LL711 $33.30 Lakeshore Learning
(Lakeshore Learning LL711) (Per Bid #2024-106)
SET | Leveled Library Set One - Level C - (Lakeshore 28961 AA835 $34.23 Lakeshore Learning
Learning AA835) (Per Bid #2024-106)
SET | Fiction Sight Word Readers - Level 2 - (Lakeshore 28928 TT536 $46.24 Lakeshore Learning
Learning TT536) (Per Bid #2024-106)
EAC | Alphabet Readers - (Lakeshore Learning GG837) 22930 GG837 $55.49 Lakeshore Learning
H (Per Bid #2024-106)
SET | Books: My First | can Read - 12/Set - 1496936 1496936 9780061478253 $10.35 LehrBook LLC
EAC | Workbook, Weekly Practice ELA, Carson Dellosa 4141 104879 $3.00 Carson Dellosa
H Publishing, LLC
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EAC | Interactive Reading Skills Series, Grades 3-8 1438176 NO BID NO BID
H
EAC | Scholastic Morning Jumpstarts, Reading, Grade 5 1470896 NO BID NO BID
H
SET | Scholastic Morning Jumpstarts, Reading, Grade 3 - 1470900 NO BID NO BID
Each
EAC | Scholastic Book - Graphic Organizers And Activities 17588 NO BID NO BID
H for Differentiated Instruction In Reading 334258
Resource
EAC | Pearson My Perspectives Teacher Edition ELA 7 - 50998 9780133338669 $48.00 Textbook Warehouse
H 9780133338669
EAC | Scholastic Informational Passages for Text Marking & | 1538280 1538280 $6.74 Complete Book
H Close Reading Book - Gr 3 & Media Supply
EAC | Transparent Front Send-Home Book Bags, Resources 40132 PE020 $19.99 Complete Book
H for Reading PE020 & Media Supply
PKG | Single Student Journal, 70 pg/4pack, "Resources for 40131 JLOO4 $40.06 Complete Book
Reading" & Media Supply
Pioneer Valley Books
EAC | The SLP's IEP Companion-Third Edition 56275 9781416410867 $47.00 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
EAC | Skilled and Vocational Trades 37834 NO BID NO BID
H
Science
EAC | National Geographic Kids: Weird but True! Ocean 37825 9781426371813 $5.64 Textbook Warehouse
H 9781340000000
EAC | Simple Machines: Forces in Action (Do It Yourself) 1755203 9781484636404 $6.26 Textbook Warehouse
H Paperback by Buffy Silverman
EAC | Mark Twain - Life Science Quest for Middle Grades - 202216 9781580374507 $8.14 Textbook Warehouse
H Paperback, ISBN-10: 1580374506, ISBN-13:
978-1580374507
EAC | Science Comics: Rocks and Minerals: Geology from 1755201 9781250203953 $8.14 Textbook Warehouse
H Caverns to the Cosmos by Andy Hirsh
EAC | Go! Field Guide: Rocks and Minerals 37822 9781338232110 $8.15 Textbook Warehouse
H 9781340000000
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EAC | Beastly Bionics 9781430000000 37819 9781426336737 $9.39 Textbook Warehouse
H
EAC | Evolution: The Story of Life on Earth Paperback, 202215 9780809043118 $11.28 Textbook Warehouse
H ISBN-10: 0809043114, ISBN-13: 978-0809043118
EAC | Ocean! Encyclopedia 9780740000000 37826 9781465435941 $12.53 Textbook Warehouse
H
EAC | Science Explorer, Motion, Forces and Energy, 37801 9780132011570 $16.70 Textbook Warehouse
H Student Edition - 0133651134
EAC | Review book - The Living Environment 0328988561 49632 9781428573215 $23.90 Textbook Warehouse
H
EAC | Perfection Learning Reviewing Earth Science: The 364555 9781567659467 $26.55 Textbook Warehouse
H physical STting by McGuire
EAC | Reviewing Earth Science: The Physical Setting, 49511 9781567659467 $26.55 Textbook Warehouse
H Perfection Learning, Amsco Publications -1344201
EAC | Inquiry in Life Science: Lab Investigations for Grades 56140 1938946243 $49.88 Textbook Warehouse
H 6-8 - ISBN-10: 1938946243
EAC | Arguing From Evidence in Middle School Science: 24 56158 #6135327 $36.27 Perma-Bound Books
H Activities for Productive Talk and Deeper Learning
1st Edition - ISBN-10: 9781506335940
EAC | Prentice Hall Brief Review Chemistry: The Physical 36093 9781418312015 $17.51 Complete Book
H Setting ISBN 0328924989 & Media Supply
EAC | POGIL Activities for Life ScienceDesigned to Support 37810 FB2324 $35.04 Complete Book
H the NGSS - FB2324 & Media Supply
EAC | POGIL Activities for Physical Science - Designed to 202217 AP10110 $35.28 Complete Book
H Support the NGSS, Flinn Scientific AP10110 & Media Supply
EAC | Inquiry in Biology: Lab Investigations for Grades 9-12 56139 9781938946202 $93.99 Complete Book
H - ISBN-10: 1938946200 & Media Supply
EAC | Interactive Science Life Science Teachers Edition 36087 9780133210125 $142.2 Complete Book
H 9780133210125 2 & Media Supply
EAC | Interactive Science Physical Science Teachers edition 36088 9780133210132 $156.0 Complete Book
H 9780133210132 0 & Media Supply
EAC | NEW YORK EARTH SCIENCE: THE PHYSICAL SETTING, 364566 T129701 $15.99 Perfection Learning
H FOURTH EDITION Perfection Learning T129701 Corporation
EAC | Squidtoons:Exploring Ocean Science with Comics by 1755202 NO BID NO BID

Garfield Kwan
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EAC | Science Textbooks Gr 3,4,5 McGraw Hill or 364533 NO BID NO BID

H National Geographic

EAC | Living Environment Review Book 37797 NO BID NO BID

H

EAC | Earth Science - JD's Regents Prep. Review Books 37815 NO BID NO BID

H

Spelling

EAC | Spelling Connections- Grade 6 - Consumable 364661 978-1453136980 | $24.93 Adams Book Co. Inc.
H Workbooks - Zaner Bloser

EAC | Spelling Dictionary for Beginning Writers 2056 49894 9780838820568 $7.35 Textbook Warehouse
H

EAC | Spelling- Grade 4 Student book- Perfection Learning 364633 9780789183897 $17.78 Complete Book

H - Consumable - 9835801 & Media Supply

EAC | Words Their Way: Word Sorts for Syllables and 202244 9780134530710 $42.29 Complete Book

H Affixes Spellers (Words Their Way Series) 3rd Edition & Media Supply

ISBN-13: 978-0134530710
EAC | Spectrum Spelling Grade 1 14626 704597 $8.44 | Spectrum Spelling g1 Carson Dellosa
H Publishing, LLC
Vocabulary

EAC | Vocabulary Workshop Student Books Grade 5 - Blue 56254 #9781421716459 | $13.02 Adams Book Co. Inc.
H Book

EAC | 240 Vocabulary Words Kids Need To Know Grade 4 1434467 9780545468640 $8.14 Textbook Warehouse
H

EAC | Vocabulary Words in Context Grade 6-8 1372683 9781420681437 $9.39 Textbook Warehouse
H

EAC | Vocabulary Words In Context, Grades 3-5 - 089931 14300 9781420681420 $9.39 Textbook Warehouse
H

EAC | Vocabulary Workshop Achieve Student Edition 364664 9781421785066 $9.95 Textbook Warehouse
H Grade 6/Level A ISBN:978-1-4217-8506-6

EAC | Vocabulary Ladders Series Grade 4 89935 9781425813031 $15.66 Textbook Warehouse
H

EAC | Vocabulary Ladders Series Grade 5 1149595 9781425813048 $15.66 Textbook Warehouse
H 2

EAC | Vocabulary Workshop Interactive ED Sadlier School 51115 9781421768595 $15.80 Textbook Warehouse
H Supply Grade 9 ISBN: 978-1-4217-6859-5
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EAC | Vocab workshop interactive Ed. Sadlier School 51116 9781421768601 $15.98 Textbook Warehouse
H Supply 10th grade ISBN: 978-1-4217-6860-1
World Language
EAC | Mi propio auto Spanish Level 2 Reader 56302 9781603723961 $8.00 Textbook Warehouse
H
EAC | LaLlorona de Mazatlan Level 2 Intermediate Spanish 364667 9781935575870 $8.99 Textbook Warehouse
H Reader Print Book 1B5010
EAC | LA GUERRA SUCA (NOVEL) CLASS ST AND TEAERS 364715 9781934958056 $10.00 Textbook Warehouse
H GUIDE
EAC | QUIERE UN PERRO LEVEL 1 BEGINNER SPANISH 37803 9781935575948 $10.00 Textbook Warehouse
H READER - BRANDON BROWN - Teacher's Discovery
1B4877
EAC | Teacher's Discovery, 5 mujeres inmigrantes Spanish 202235 1B7076 $7.29 Complete Book
H Level 2 Enhanced Reader & Media Supply
EAC | CAPYBARA CON BOTAS (NOVEL) 364668 9780991441136 $9.96 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
EAC | Bertoy sus buenas ideas Spanish Level 1 Reader - 37807 1B6299 $10.03 Complete Book
H 1B6299 & Media Supply
EAC | LA VAMPIRATA SPANISH LEVEL 2 READER - Teacher's 37804 1B7149 $10.03 Complete Book
H Discovery & Media Supply
EAC | 21 minicuentos Spanish Level 1 Student Reader 56301 1B3680 $12.15 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
EAC | Agentes Secretos class ST by Mira Canion 364714 9781947006034 $13.79 Complete Book
H | 9781947006034 TEAERSDISCOVERY.COM & Media Supply
EAC | Spanish Short Stories for Beginners: 25 Engaging 37800 9798725857580 $18.74 Complete Book
H Tales to Build Your Vocabulary and Learn the Fast & & Media Supply
Fun Way! (Spanish Made Easy) Paperback ISBN-13 :
979-8725857580
EAC | Month Spanish Homework Chart ,Teacher's 4904315 1P1541 $36.45 Complete Book
H Discovery & Media Supply
EAC | Dibujar para hablar, Teacher's Discovery 4904313 GP1B6074 $37.25 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
EAC | Microcuentos cubanos book,Teacher's Discovery 4904314 1B6370 $37.25 Complete Book
H & Media Supply
EAC | Teacher's Discovery, Lecturas Culturales de Mexico 202242 1B6027DL $37.25 Complete Book
H Download & Media Supply
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EAC | Teacher's Discovery, Authentic Spanish Tongue 202236 1E2008 $50.12 Complete Book
H Twister Signs & Media Supply

EAC | GROW! CREZCA! Language Building Storybooks: 37181 GR2008 $86.48 Complete Book
H English-Spanish Book Set & Media Supply

Writing & Grammar

EAC | Zaner Bloser Handwriting Workbooks for 406104 978-1453119273 $16.86 Adams Book Co. Inc.
H Kindergarten

EAC | Words | Use When | Write - 0838860 51022 9780838860434 $3.65 Textbook Warehouse
H

EAC | Words | Use When | Write Books - 9780838860434 17542 9780838860434 $3.65 Textbook Warehouse
H

EAC | Words | use when | write dictionaries Y466 36134 9780838860434 $3.65 Textbook Warehouse
H

EAC | Writing And Grammar Workbook, Grade 1 - 14622 9780328146222 $4.95 Textbook Warehouse
H 0-328-14622-6

EAC | Book Daily 5-Trait Writing Grade 5 - 1463235 28710 9781609633400 $5.64 Textbook Warehouse
H

EAC | Zaner- Bloser Handwriting Grade 3 - ISBN 56278 9781453117989 $8.25 Textbook Warehouse
H 978-1-4531-1798-9

EAC | Zaner Bloser, 3 Cursiveq 406103 9781453119310 $13.55 Textbook Warehouse
H

SET | Handwriting Without Tears-My First Book Set 37796 9781950578122 $19.33 Textbook Warehouse

(includes My First School Book + My First Lowercase
Book)

EAC | Grammar, Usage, and Mechanics Student 364577 9781453112069 $22.00 Textbook Warehouse
H Workbooks - Zane Bolser 978-1-4531-1206-9

EAC | A Writer's Reference With Exercises, 9th Edition - 37798 9781319106966 $80.75 Textbook Warehouse
H Bedford, Freeman & Worth 131910696x

EAC | Curriculum Associates, Everyday Writers Quick Word 202212 9780891875390 $8.71 Complete Book
H Book (yellow) & Media Supply

EAC | Quick-Word Handbooks: Everyday Writers WS132 29836 9780891875390 $8.71 Complete Book
H 978-0-89187-539-0 & Media Supply

EAC | Learning Without Tears Grade 4 Student Cursive 364709 9781952970818 $16.92 Complete Book
H Success Writing Workbook Item/Code: CS-18 & Media Supply
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EAC | Keys for Writers by Ann Raimes and Susan 202203 9781305956759 $76.10 Complete Book
H Miller-Cochran, 8th Edition, ISBN-13 & Media Supply
978-1305956759
EAC | Grade 2-5 Cursive Resource Book 56224 0866 $5.00 Cursive Res BK G2-5 Carson Dellosa
H Publishing, LLC
EAC | The Complete Book of Handwriting Grades K-3 006001 704930 $6.00 Complete bk Carson Dellosa
H of handwriting Publishing, LLC
EAC | Grammar And Writing Practice Book, Student 17560 NO BID NO BID
H Edition, Grade 5 - 032-8146269




